
  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Gusto 6 L  

 
The new Gusto 6 L is all about efficiency and capacity; a 
whopping 326 mixed confectionery and cold drinks from 
this combination version. The Gusto 6 L has made great 
strides with thermal efficiency. Using foam insulation and 
an internal structure made of PVC combined with a new 
cooling unit with R290 technology for low environmental 
impact and high energy saving, the Gusto 6 L is 30% 
more efficient than any previous versions of Evoca 
snacks or combination snacks and cold drinks machines.  
Evoca’s optional remote telemetry package, giving you 
the ability to change the digital prices remotely and have 
access to sales data. Refrigeration is provided by a high 
efficiency three temperature zone cooling unit, offering a 
low energy consumption, at 1125 kWh/per annum. With 
extensive insulation of the cabinet, L.E.D. lighting and an 
advanced energy management the Gusto 6 L has class 
leading energy rating of C, good for your wallet and the 
environment. All of these features will help to increase 
sales, enhance user experience and simplify operating 
tasks. 

 

• Simple touch keypad buttons and clear graphic 
screen makes the Gusto 6 Classic M is easy to use. 

• The latest operating platform allows payment by 
contactless card or mobile phone 

• Change prices and monitor performance using 
optional remote telemetry technology 

• Class leading energy rating of C 

• Gusto 6L has a total capacity of 326 items 

• Temperature Food 0°-4° Snacks/Cold drinks 8°-15° 

• Footprint 1830mm (h) x 746mm (w) x 874mm (d) 

• Weight 225Kg  
 

Product Group 

Combination 
 

Product Sub-Group 

Food/Snacks & Cold Drinks 


